G:\M\IT\TONKO\TONKO_045.XML

AMENDMENT TO
RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 117-13

OFFERED BY MR. TONKO

At the end of title LX of division K, insert the fol-

lowing:

1 SEC. 6013. EXTENSION OF NHA AUTHORIZATIONS.

2 (a) EXTENSIONS.—Notwithstanding any other provi-
3 sion of law, the authorization of appropriations for each
4 National Heritage Area with an authorization expiring in
5 2021 is extended through September 30, 2023.

6 (b) NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA DEFINED.—For the
7 purposes of subsection (a), the term ‘“National Heritage
8 Area’” means each of the following:

9 (1) A National Heritage Area.

10 (2) A National Heritage Corridor.

11 (3) A Cultural Heritage Corridor.

12 (4) A Heritage Preservation Commission.

13 (5) A National Heritage Route.

14 (6) A Heritage Partnership.

15 (7) A National Heritage Partnership.

16 (8) A National Historie District.

17 (9) An area designated as a national heritage

18 area through Federal statute.

g:\VHLC\091421\091421.089.xml (82066812)

September 14, 2021 (5:46 p.m.)



G:\M\IT\TONKO\TONKO_045.XML

2

(¢) MANAGEMENT PrAN  EXTENSION.—Section
6001(c¢) of the John D. Dingell, Jr. Conservation, Man-
agement, and Recreation Act (Public Law 116-9; 54
U.S.C. 320101 note) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking ““3 years after
the date of enactment of this Act” and inserting
“September 30, 2023”; and

(2) in paragraph (3), by striking “the date that
is 3 years after the date of enactment of this Act”
and inserting “September 30, 2023,

(d) PuBLic Law 106-554.—Section 810(a)(1) of
title VIII of division B of appendix D of Public Law 106—
554, as amended (114 Stat. 2763; 123 Stat. 1295; 131
Stat. 461; 133 Stat. 2714), is further amended by striking
“$14,000,000” and inserting “$16,000,000”.

(e) PuBLIC LAw 98-398.—Section 125(a) of Public
Law 98-398, as amended by section 402 of Public Law
109-338 (120 Stat. 1853), is amended by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$12,000,000”.

(f) PuBLic Liaw 106-278.—Section 210(a) of title
II of Public Law 106-278 (114 Stat. 824) is amended
by striking “$10,000,000” and inserting “$12,000,000”.

g:\VHLC\091421\091421.089.xml (82066812)
September 14, 2021 (5:46 p.m.)




  
   G:\M\17\TONKO\TONKO_045.XML XXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 9/14/2021 17:38 XXXXXX 09/08/2021 4:06 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 
  820668|2
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 117th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to 
 Rules Committee Print 117-13 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Tonko 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of title LX of division E, insert the following: 
  
  6013. Extension of NHA authorizations 
  (a) Extensions Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the authorization of appropriations for each National Heritage Area with an authorization expiring in 2021 is extended through September 30, 2023.  
  (b) National heritage area defined For the purposes of subsection (a), the term  National Heritage Area means each of the following: 
  (1) A National Heritage Area. 
  (2) A National Heritage Corridor. 
  (3) A Cultural Heritage Corridor. 
  (4) A Heritage Preservation Commission. 
  (5) A National Heritage Route. 
  (6) A Heritage Partnership. 
  (7) A National Heritage Partnership. 
  (8) A National Historic District. 
  (9) An area designated as a national heritage area through Federal statute. 
  (c) Management plan extension Section 6001(c) of the John D. Dingell, Jr. Conservation, Management, and Recreation Act (Public Law 116–9; 54 U.S.C. 320101 note) is amended— 
  (1) in paragraph (1), by striking  3 years after the date of enactment of this Act and inserting  September 30, 2023; and 
  (2) in paragraph (3), by striking  the date that is 3 years after the date of enactment of this Act and inserting  September 30, 2023. 
  (d) Public Law 106–554 Section 810(a)(1) of title VIII of division B of appendix D of Public Law 106–554, as amended (114 Stat. 2763; 123 Stat. 1295; 131 Stat. 461; 133 Stat. 2714), is further amended by striking  $14,000,000 and inserting  $16,000,000. 
  (e) Public Law 98–398 Section 125(a) of Public Law 98–398, as amended by section 402 of Public Law 109–338 (120 Stat. 1853), is amended by striking  $10,000,000 and inserting  $12,000,000. 
  (f) Public Law 106–278 Section 210(a) of title II of Public Law 106–278 (114 Stat. 824) is amended by striking  $10,000,000 and inserting  $12,000,000. 
 

